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Erratum
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In the Table of Contents, page 1749, Draft Regulations, 
the heading should read “Professional recognition of med-
ical electrophysiology technologists, An Act respecting 
the… — Medical electrophysiology technologists — 
Regulatory standards applicable to persons other than 
medical electrophysiology technologists to engage in 
professional activities that may be engaged in by medical 
electrophysiology technologists” instead of “Professional 
Code — Medical electrophysiology technologists — 
Regulatory standards applicable to persons other than 
medical electrophysiology technologists to engage in 
professional activities that may be engaged in by medical 
electrophydiology technologists”.

In the Index, page 1817, seventh entry, the text should 
read “Medical electrophysiology technologists — 
Regulatory standards applicable to persons other than 
medical electrophysiology technologists to engage in 
professional activities that may be engaged in by medical 
electrophysiology technologists (An Act respecting the 
professional recognition of medical electrophysiology 
technologists, 2012, chapter 10)” instead of “Medical 
electrophysiology technologists — Regulatory standards 
applicable to persons other than medical electrophysiology 
technologists to engage in professional activities that may 
be engaged in by medical electrophydiology technologists 
(Professional Code, chapter C-26)”.

In the Index, page 1817, tenth entry, the text should 
read “Professional recognition of medical electrophysio-
logy technologists, An Act respecting the… — Medical 
electrophysiology technologists — Regulatory standards 
applicable to persons other than medical electrophysio-
logy technologists to engage in professional activities that 
may be engaged in by medical electrophysiology technolo-
gists (2012, chapter 10)” instead of “Professional Code 
— Medical electrophysiology technologists — Regulatory 
standards applicable to persons other than medical electro-
physiology technologists to engage in professional activi-
ties that may be engaged in by medical electrophydiology 
technologists (chapter C-26)”.
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