
2244 GAZETTE OFFICIELLE DU QUÉBEC, May 17, 2000, Vol. 132, No. 20 Part 2

Wager Payout Odds

Total of 17 50 to 1
Duo 5 to 1
Small 1 to 1
Big 1 to 1
Single:
One of the dice 1 to 1
Two of the dice 2 to 1
Three of the dice 3 to 1".

5. The said By-law is amended by the deletion of
Section VI — Sic Bo.

6. The said By-law comes into effect on the fifteenth
day following its date of publication in the Gazette
officielle du Québec.

NOTICE OF THE RÉGIE DES ALCOOLS, DES
COURSES ET DES JEUX REGARDING THE
BY-LAW AMENDING THE BY-LAW RESPECTING
CASINO GAMES

In accordance with the second paragraph of section 13
of the Act respecting the Société des loteries du Québec
(R.S.Q., c. S-13.1), the Régie des alcools, des courses et
des jeux is publishing its notice regarding the By-law
amending the By-law respecting casino games.

ME SERGE LAFONTAINE,
President of the Régie des alcools,
des courses et des jeux

Notice of the Régie des alcools, des courses et des
jeux regarding the By-law amending the By-law
respecting casino games

The Régie des alcools, des courses et des jeux, in
plenary meeting on Wednesday, May 3rd, 2000, ex-
presses a favorable opinion regarding the By-law amend-
ing the By-law respecting casino games which was trans-
mitted to it by the Société des loteries du Québec on
February 3rd, 2000, in conformity with the second para-
graph of section 13 of the Act respecting the Société des
loteries du Québec (R.S.Q., c. S-13.1).

3605

Draft Regulation
An Act respecting family benefits
(R.S.Q., c. P-19.1)

Family benefits
— Amendments

Notice is hereby given, in accordance with sections 10
and 11 of the Regulations Act (R.S.Q., c. R-18.1), that
the Regulation to amend the Regulation respecting fam-
ily benefits, the text of which appears below, may be
made by the Government upon the expiry of 45 days
following this publication.

The draft Regulation amends the amount of the fam-
ily allowance.

Further information may be obtained by contacting
Ms. Josée Perreault, at the Régie des rentes du Québec,
2600, boulevard Laurier, Sainte-Foy, C.P. 5200, G1K 7S9;
telephone: (418) 657-8732, extension 3931; fax: (418)
659-8985; email: josee.perreault@rrq.gouv.qc.ca.

Any person having comments to make on the matter
is asked to send them in writing, before the expiry of the
45-day period, to the President-General Manager of the
Régie des rentes du Québec, 2600, boulevard Laurier,
bureau 546, Sainte-Foy, C.P. 5200, G1K 7S9; fax: (418)
643-9586.

All comments will be sent to the Minister of Child
and Family Welfare and to the Minister for Child and
Family Welfare.

PAULINE MAROIS, NICOLE LÉGER,
Minister of Child and Minister for Child and

Family Welfare Family Welfare

Regulation to amend the Regulation
respecting family benefits*
An Act respecting family benefits
(R.S.Q., c. P-19.1, s. 8, 1st par., subpar. 1)

1. Section 9 of the Regulation respecting family ben-
efits is amended

* The Regulation respecting family benefits made by Order in
Council 1018-97 dated 13 August 1997 (1997, G.O., 2, 4363) was
last amended by the Regulation made by Order in Council 1480-99
dated 17 December 1999 (2000, G.O. 2, 13). For previous amend-
ments, refer to the Tableau des modifications et Index sommaire,
Éditeur officiel du Québec, 2000, updated to 1 February 2000.

BOUCHAPI
Draft Regulation



Part 2 GAZETTE OFFICIELLE DU QUÉBEC, May 17, 2000, Vol. 132, No. 20 2245

(1) by substituting “$1 925” for “$2 095” and “$625”
for “$795” in item a of subparagraph 1 of the second
paragraph;

(2) by substituting “$625” for “$795” in item b of
subparagraph 1 of the second paragraph;

(3) by substituting “$21 214” for “$20 921” in item a
of subparagraph 2 of the second paragraph; and

(4) by substituting “$80” for “$131” and “$80” for
“$174” in the third paragraph.

2. Section 10 is amended by substituting “$80” for
“$131” and “$80” for “$174” in subparagraph 1 of the
first paragraph.

3. This Regulation comes into force on 1 August
2000.

3507


