
Part 2 GAZETTE OFFICIELLE DU QUÉBEC, December 22, 1999, Vol. 131, No. 52 4587

Regulations and Other Acts

Gouvernement du Québec

O.C. 1373-99, 8 December 1999
An Act respecting income support, employment
assistance and social solidarity
(1998, c. 36)

Income support
— Amendments

Regulation to amend the Regulation respecting in-
come support

WHEREAS, in accordance with the Act respecting in-
come support, employment assistance and social solidar-
ity (1998, c. 36), the Government made the Regulation
respecting income support by Order in Council 1011-99
dated 1 September 1999;

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Regulation;

WHEREAS, under section 12 of the Regulations Act
(R.S.Q., c. R-18.1), a draft regulation may be made
without having been published in accordance with sec-
tion 8 of that Act, where the authority making it is of the
opinion that the urgency of the situation requires it;

WHEREAS, under section 18 of that Act, a regulation
may come into force between the date of its publication
in the Gazette officielle du Québec and the date appli-
cable under section 17 of that Act, where the authority
that has made it is of the opinion that the urgency of the
situation requires it;

WHEREAS, under sections 13 and 18 of that Act, the
reason justifying the absence of prior publication and
such coming into force must be published with the regu-
lation;

WHEREAS the Government is of the opinion that the
urgency due to the following circumstances justifies the
absence of prior publication and such coming into force:

— the amendments in the attached Regulation relate
to the annual increase in certain benefits according to
the adjustment rate prescribed under the Act respecting
the Québec Pension Plan (R.S.Q., c. R-9) and must
come into force on 1 January 2000; since the data re-
quired to determine the rate were not available before
19 November 1999, the time prescribed for prior publi-

cation and the date of coming into force would not allow
the coming into force of the amendments on 1 January
2000;

WHEREAS it is expedient to make the Regulation;

IT IS ORDERED, therefore, upon the recommendation
of the Minister of Social Solidarity:

THAT the Regulation to amend the Regulation re-
specting income support, attached hereto, be made.

MICHEL NOËL DE TILLY ,
Clerk of the Conseil exécutif

Regulation to amend the Regulation
respecting income support*

An Act respecting income support, employment
assistance and social solidarity
(1998, c. 36, s. 156, pars. 5, 8, 11 19, 29, and s. 160)

1. Section 9 of the Regulation respecting income sup-
port is amended

(1) by substituting the amounts “ $737”, “ $1 062”,
“ $1 262”, “ $1 096”, “ $1 313” and “ $1 513” for
“ $726”, “ $1 051”, “ $1 251”, “ $1 079”, “ $1 296” and
“ $1 496” respectively, in the first paragraph;

(2) by substituting the amount “ $375” for “ $330” in
the third paragraph; and

(3) by substituting the amount “ $151” for “ $149” in
the fifth paragraph.

2. Section 25 is amended by substituting the amount
“ $230” for “ $224”.

3. Sections 26, 27 and 28 are amended by substitut-
ing the amount “ $151” for “ $149”.

4. Section 32 is amended by substituting the amount
“ $235” for “ $224” and the amount “ $325” for “ $308”
wherever it appears.

5. Section 90 is amended

* The Regulaion respecting income support was made by Order in
Council 1011-99 dated 1 September 1999 (1999, G.O. 2, 2881) and
has not been amended since that date.

gazette officielle



4588 GAZETTE OFFICIELLE DU QUÉBEC, December 22, 1999, Vol. 131, No. 52 Part 2

(1) by substituting the amounts “ $737”, “ $1 062”,
“ $1 262”, “ $1 096”, “ $1 313” and “ $1 513” for
“ $726”, “ $1 051”, “ $1 251”, “ $1 079”, “ $1 296” and
“ $1 496” respectively, in the first paragraph;

(2) by substituting the amount “ $375” for “ $330” in
the third paragraph; and

(3) by substituting the amount “ $151” for “ $149” in
the fifth paragraph.

6. Section 150 is amended by substituting the amounts
“ $737”, “ $1 062”, “ $1 262”, “ $1 096”, “ $1 313” and
“ $1 513” for “ $726”, “ $1 051”, “ $1 251”, “ $1 079”,
“ $1 296” and “ $1 496” respectively, in subparagraph 1
of the first paragraph.

7. This Regulation comes into force on 1 January
2000.

3268

Gouvernement du Québec

O.C. 1376-99, 8 December 1999
An Act respecting labour relations, vocational training
and manpower management in the construction industry
(R.S.Q., c. R-20)

Commission de la construction du Québec
— Levy

Levy Regulation of the Commission de la construc-
tion du Québec

WHEREAS under paragraph c of the first paragraph of
section 82 of the Act respecting labour relations, voca-
tional training and manpower management in the con-
struction industry (R.S.Q., c. R-20), the Commission de
la construction du Québec may, by way of a regulation
approved by the Government and published in the Ga-
zette officielle du Québec, levy upon the employer alone
or upon both the employer and the employee, or upon
the employee alone or, as the case may be, upon the
independent contractor, the amounts required for its ad-
ministration and fix a minimum amount which an em-
ployer is bound to pay per monthly period;

WHEREAS after consulting with the Joint Committee
on Construction in accordance with section 123.3 of the
Act, the Commission made the Levy Regulation for the
year 2000;

WHEREAS under section 12 of the Regulations Act
(R.S.Q., c. R-18.1), a proposed regulation may be ap-
proved without having been published as provided for in
section 8 of that Act if the authority approving it is of the
opinion that the urgency of the situation requires it;

WHEREAS under section 18 of that Act, a regulation
may come into force between the date of its publication
in the Gazette officielle du Québec and the date appli-
cable under section 17 of that Act where the authority
that has approved it is of the opinion that the urgency of
the situation requires it;

WHEREAS under sections 13 and 18 of that Act, the
reason justifying the absence of a prior publication and
such coming into force shall be published with the regu-
lation;

WHEREAS the Government is of the opinion that the
urgency due to the following circumstances justifies the
absence of a prior publication and such coming into
force:

— it is expedient to set the levy rate of the Commis-
sion de la construction du Québec for the year 2000
before 1 January 2000;

WHEREAS it is expedient to approve the Levy Regula-
tion;

IT IS ORDERED, therefore, upon the recommendation
of the Minister of State for Labour and Employment and
Minister of Labour:

THAT the Levy Regulation of the Commission de la
construction du Québec, attached to this Order in Coun-
cil, be approved.

MICHEL NOËL DE TILLY ,
Clerk of the Conseil exécutif

Levy Regulation of the Commission de la
construction du Québec
An Act respecting labour relations, vocational training
and manpower management in the construction industry
(R.S.Q., c. R-20, s. 82)

1. The levy imposed by the Commission de la con-
struction du Québec, for the year 2000, is:

(1) in the case of an employer, 0.75 % of the total
remuneration paid to his employees;


