
1434 GAZETTE OFFICIELLE DU QUÉBEC, April 9, 1997, Vol. 129, No. 14 Part 2

Gouvernement du Québec

O.C. 438-97, 26 March 1997
Highway Safety Code
(R.S.Q., c. C-24.2)

Road vehicle registration
— Amendments

Regulation to amend the Regulation respecting road
vehicle registration

WHEREAS under paragraphs 8.3 and 8.4 of section 618
and sections 619.1 and 619.3 of the Highway Safety
Code (R.S.Q., c. C-24.2), the Government may fix, by
regulation, the duties exigible for obtaining the registra-
tion of a road vehicle, for obtaining and retaining the
right to operate such vehicle and it may prescribe calcu-
lation methods for those duties;

WHEREAS under section 12 of the Regulations Act
(R.S.Q., c. R-18.1), a proposed regulation may be ap-
proved notwithstanding the publication requirement in
section 8 of that Act if the authority approving it is of the
opinion that the urgency of the situation requires it;

WHEREAS under section 18 of that Act, a regulation
may come into force on the date of its publication in the
Gazette officielle du Québec where the authority that
has approved it is of the opinion that the urgency of the
situation requires it;

WHEREAS under section 13 and 18 of that Act, the
reason justifying the absence of prior publication and
such coming into force shall be published with the Regu-
lation;

WHEREAS in the opinion of the Government, the ur-
gency due to the following circumstances justifies the
absence of prior publication and such coming into force:

— it is expedient to amend the Regulation respecting
road vehicle registration to give effect to the Budget
Speech of 25 March 1997, which provides for a raise in
the registration duties of road vehicles becoming due
from May 1997;

— under paragraph 3 of section 19 of the Regulation
respecting road vehicle registration, the owner of a mo-
tor home or of a passenger vehicle whose surname begins
with D, E or F must pay between 1 March and 31 May
the duties to retain the right to operate his vehicle;

— as of 9 April 1997, the Société will prepare the
notices sent by mail on which the amount to be paid by
the above-mentioned owners is indicated;

— consequently, the regulatory provisions that raise
the annual duties exigible to retain the right to operate a
registered vehicle must come into force on 9 April 1997;

WHEREAS it is expedient that the Regulation be made
by the Government;

IT IS ORDERED, therefore, on the recommendation of
the Minister of Transport:

THAT the Regulation to amend the Regulation re-
specting road vehicle registration, attached to this Order
in Council, be made.

MICHEL CARPENTIER,
Clerk of the Conseil exécutif

Regulation to amend the Regulation
respecting road vehicle registration
Highway Safety Code
(R.S.Q., c. C-24.2, s. 618, pars 8.3 and 8.4 and
ss. 619.1 and 619.3)

1. The Regulation respecting road vehicle registra-
tion, made by Order in Council 1420-91 dated 16 Octo-
ber 1991 and amended by O.C. 1408-92 dated 23 Sep-
tember 1992, 1876-92 dated 16 December 1992, 1510-93
dated 27 October 1993, 1382-95 dated 18 October 1995,
1437-95 dated 1 November 1995, 720-96 dated 12 June
1996 and 1263-96 dated 2 October 1996, is further
amended by substituting “$36.40” for “$30.80” in sec-
tion 79.

2. The following is substituted for section 81:

“ 81. The monthly fees for a motorcycle are $6.67.”.

3. Section 82 is amended by substituting “$18.20” for
“$15.40”.

4. Section 83 is amended by substituting “$32.50” for
“$29.70”.

5. Section 84 is amended by substituting “$39.40” for
“$36.60”.

6. Section 85 is amended by substituting “$46.30” for
“$43.50”.

7. Section 86 is amended by substituting “$8.67” for
“$6.33”.

8. Section 97 is amended by substituting “$104” for
“$76”.

letource
O.C. 438-97, 26 March 1997



Part 2 GAZETTE OFFICIELLE DU QUÉBEC, April 9, 1997, Vol. 129, No. 14 1435

9. The following is substituted for the second para-
graph of section 101:

“The fees payable to retain the right to operate a
motorcycle are $40 for each payment period.”.

10. Section 103 is amended by substituting “$71” for
“$43”.

11. Section 104 is amended by substituting “$182”
for “$154”.

12. Section 105 is amended by substituting “$182”
for “$154”.

13. Section 106 is amended by substituting “$327”
for “$299”.

14. Section 107 is amended by substituting “$435”
for “$407”.

15. Section 108 is amended by substituting “$570”
for “$542”.

16. Section 109 is amended by substituting “$104”
for “$76”.

17. Section 111 is amended:

(1) by substituting “$400” for “$372”;

(2) by substituting “$696” for “$668”;

(3) by substituting “$1 207” for “$1 179”;

(4) by substituting “$1 771” for “$1 743”;

(5) by substituting “$2 162” for “$2 134”;

(6) by substituting “$2 961” for “$2 933”.

18. Section 112 is amended:

(1) by substituting “$177” for “$149”;

(2) by substituting “$295” for “$267”;

(3) by substituting “$506” for “$478”;

(4) by substituting “$732” for “$704”;

(5) by substituting “$927” for “$899”;

(6) by substituting “$1 247” for “$1 219”.

19. Section 115 is amended by substituting “$182”
for “$154”.

20. Section 116 is amended by substituting “$454”
for “$426”.

21. Section 117 is amended by substituting “$610”
for “$582”.

22. Section 118 is amended by substituting “$758”
for “$730”.

23. Section 119 is amended by substituting “$325”
for “$297”.

24. Section 120 is amended by substituting “$394”
for “$366”.

25. Section 121 is amended by substituting “$463”
for “$435”.

26. Section 125 is amended by substituting “$25” for
“$7”.

27. Section 126 is amended by substituting “$74” for
“$46”.

28. Section 127 is amended by substituting “$117”
for “$89”.

29. Section 128 is amended by substituting “$151”
for “$123”.

30. Section 129 is amended by substituting “$191”
for “$163”.

31. Section 130 is amended by substituting “$139”
for “$111”.

32. Section 131 is amended by substituting “$229”
for “$201”.

33. Section 132 is amended by substituting “$386”
for “$358”.

34. Section 133 is amended by substituting “$556”
for “$528”.

35. Section 134 is amended by substituting “$708”
for “$680”.

36. Section 135 is amended by substituting “$948”
for “$920”.

37. Section 147 is amended by substituting “$50.42”
for “$48.08”.

38. Section 148 is amended by substituting “$605”
for “$577”.



1436 GAZETTE OFFICIELLE DU QUÉBEC, April 9, 1997, Vol. 129, No. 14 Part 2

39. Section 154 is amended:

(1) by substituting the following for the first para-
graph:

“ 154. The fee payable for obtaining the registration
of a road vehicle in one of the categories covered by
section 149 and to retain the right to operate a vehicle
with a net weight of 500 kg or less in one of those
categories is calculated by multiplying the monthly fee
of $3.33 by the number of full months, plus one, be-
tween the date on which registration is applied for and
the last day of the month preceding the last month dur-
ing which the amounts provided for in the first para-
graph of section 31.1 of the Highway Safety Code next
become due.”;

(2) by substituting “$24.58” for “$22.25”;

(3) by substituting “$50.42” for “$48.08”.

40. The following is substituted for section 155:

“ 155. The registration fee for a vehicle in a category
covered by section 149 payable to retain the right to
operate a vehicle with a net weight of 500 kg or less in
one of those categories is $40 for each payment pe-
riod.”.

41. Section 156 is amended by substituting “$295”
for “$267”.

42. Section 157 is amended by substituting “$605”
for “$577”.

43. The fees set under this regulation are payable
upon the registration of vehicles after April 30, 1997
and to retain the right to operate a vehicle for which
payment is received by the Société de l’assurance auto-
mobile du Québec after April 8, 1997 and the due date
for payment is later than April 30, 1997 under sec-
tions 19 to 24 of the Regulation respecting road vehicle
registration.

44. This regulation comes into force on May 1, 1997,
except for section 8 which comes into force on April 9,
1997.

1368

Decision CCQ-972184, 26 March 1997
An Act respecting labour relations, vocational training
and manpower management in the construction industry
(R.S.Q., c. R-20)

Complementary social benefit plans
— Amendments

Notice is hereby given that by Decision CCQ-972184
of 26 March 1997, the Commission de la Construction
du Québec has enacted the Regulation to amend the
Regulation respecting complementary social benefit plans
in the construction industry. This regulation brings some
changes to the insurance and pension benefits of the
employees of the construction industry.

This regulation is enacted under the authority of sec-
tion 92 of the Act respecting labour relations, vocational
training and manpower management in the construction
industry (R.S .Q., c. R-20); it brings into effect sec-
tions 28.01 to 28.07 of the Construction Decree enacted
by Order in Council 172-87 of 4 February 1987. The
provisions of said sections are deemed to constitute
common clauses applicable to collective agreements for
each of the sectors of the construction industry, pursuant
to section 84 of the Act to amend the Act respecting
labour relations, vocational training and manpower man-
agement in the construction industry and to amend other
legal provisions (1993, c. 61).

A draft of this regulation was submitted by the Com-
mission to the Joint Committee on Construction, in ac-
cordance with section 123.3 of the Act respecting labour
relations, vocational training and manpower manage-
ment in the construction industry. The Joint Committee
has issued a notice to the effect that it was in favour of
adopting the Regulation to amend the Regulation re-
specting complementary social benefit plans in the con-
struction industry.

ANDRÉ MÉNARD,
Chairman and Chief executive officer

Regulation to amend the Regulation
respecting complementary social benefit
plans in the construction industry
An Act respecting labour relations, vocational training
and manpower management in the construction
industry
(R.S.Q., c. R-20, s. 92; 1995, c. 8, s. 42; 1996, c. 74,
s. 45)

1. The Regulation respecting complementary social
benefit plans in the construction industry enacted by


