
Gazette officielle du Québec

Part 2
Laws and
Regulations

Summary

Table of Contents
Regulations and other acts
Index

Volume 132
15 July 2000
No. 28A

All rights reserved in all countries. No part of this publication may
be translated, used or reproduced by any means, whether electronic
or mechanical, including micro-reproduction, without the written
authorization of the Québec Official Publisher.

Legal deposit — 1st Quarter 1968
Bibliothèque nationale du Québec
© Éditeur officiel du Québec, 2000





Part 2 GAZETTE OFFICIELLE DU QUÉBEC, July 15, 2000, Vol. 132, No. 28A 3613

Table of Contents   Page

Regulations and other acts

890-2000 Family benefits (Amend.)  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 3615
896-2000 Income support (Amend.)  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 3616





Part 2 GAZETTE OFFICIELLE DU QUÉBEC, July 15, 2000, Vol. 132, No. 28A 3615

Regulations and other acts

Gouvernement du Québec

O.C. 890-2000, 13 July 2000
An Act respecting family benefits
(R.S.Q., c. P-19.1)

Family benefits
— Amendments

Regulation to amend the Regulation respecting family
benefits

WHEREAS subparagraph 2 of the first paragraph of
section 8 of the Act respecting family benefits (R.S.Q.,
c. P-19.1) allows the Government to determine, by regu-
lation, the method for determining income used to deter-
mine the amount of family allowance;

WHEREAS in accordance with sections 10 and 11 of
the Regulations Act (R.S.Q., c. R-18.1), the draft Regu-
lation to amend the Regulation respecting family ben-
efits was published in Part 2 of the Gazette officielle du
Québec of 17 May 2000, with a notice that it could be
made upon the expiry of 45 days following that
publication;

WHEREAS it is expedient to make the Regulation with-
out amendment;

IT IS ORDERED, therefore, upon the recommendation
of the Minister of Child and Family Welfare and the
Minister for Child and Family Welfare:

THAT the Regulation to amend the Regulation
respecting family benefits, attached to this Order in
Council, be made.

MICHEL NOËL DE TILLY ,
Clerk of the Conseil exécutif

Regulation to amend the Regulation
respecting family benefits1

An Act respecting family benefits
(R.S.Q., c. P-19.1, s. 8, 1st par., subpar. 1)

1. Section 9 of the Regulation respecting family
benefits is amended

(1) by substituting “$1 925” for “$2 095” and “$625”
for “$795” in item a of subparagraph 1 of the second
paragraph;

(2) by substituting “$625” for $795” in item b of
subparagraph 1 of the second paragraph;

(3) by substituting “$21 214” for “$20 921” in item a
of subparagraph 2 of the second paragraph; and

(4) by substituting “$80” for “$131” and “$80” for
“$174” in the third paragraph.

2. Section 10 is amended by substituting “$80” for
“$131” and “$80” for “$174” in subparagraph 1 of the
first paragraph.

3. This Regulation comes into force on 1 August
2000.

3768

1 The Regulation respecting family benefits made by Order in
Council 1018-97 dated 13 August 1997 (1997, G.O. 2, 4363) was
last amended by the Regulation made by Order in Council 1480-99
dated 17 December 1999 (2000, G.O. 2, 13). For previous amend-
ments, refer to the Tableau des modifications et Index sommaire,
Éditeur officiel du Québec, 2000, updated to 1 February 2000.



3616 GAZETTE OFFICIELLE DU QUÉBEC, July 15, 2000, Vol. 132, No. 28A Part 2

Gouvernement du Québec

O.C. 896-2000, 13 July 2000
An Act respecting income support, employment
assistance and social solidarity
(R.S.Q., c. S-32.001)

Income support
— Amendments

Regulation to amend the Regulation respecting income
support

WHEREAS, in accordance with the Act respecting
income support, employment assistance and social soli-
darity (R.S.Q., c. S-32.001), the Government made the
Regulation respecting income support by Order in Coun-
cil 1011-99 dated 1 September 1999;

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Regulation;

WHEREAS, under sections 10, 12 and 13 of the Regu-
lations Act (R.S.Q., c. R-18.1), a draft of the Regulation
to amend the Regulation respecting income support was
published in Part 2 of the Gazette officielle du Québec of
7 June 2000, p. 2543, with a notice that it could be made
by the Government upon the expiry of 25 days follow-
ing that publication;

WHEREAS the 25-day period has expired;

WHEREAS it is expedient to make the Regulation with
amendments;

IT IS ORDERED, therefore, upon the recommendation
of the Minister of Social Solidarity:

THAT the Regulation to amend the Regulation
respecting income support, attached to this Order in
Council, be made.

MICHEL NOËL DE TILLY ,
Clerk of the Conseil exécutif

Regulation to amend the Regulation
respecting income support*

An Act respecting income support, employment
assistance and social solidarity
(R.S.Q., c. S-32.001, s. 156, par. 12, ss. 160 and 161)

1. Section 35 of the Regulation respecting income
support is amended by substituting the amount “$52.08”
for “$66.25”.

2. Section 36 is amended by substituting the amount
“$81.41” for “$81.42”.

3. Section 39 is amended by substituting the amounts
“$234.50” and “$217.33” for “$225.67” and “$209”.

4. This Regulation comes into force on 1 August 2000.

3769

* The Regulation respecting income support, made by Order in
Council 1011-99 dated 1 September 1999 (1999, G.O. 2, 2881),
was last amended by the Regulations made by Orders in Coun-
cil 339-2000 dated 22 March 2000 (2000, G.O. 2, 1840), 546-2000
dated 3 May 2000 (2000, G.O. 2, 2206), 637-2000 dated 24 May
2000 (G.O. 2, 2535) and 707-2000 dated 7 June 2000 (2000,
G.O. 2, 2661). For previous amendments, refer to the Tableau des
modifications et Index sommaire, Éditeur officiel du Québec, 2000,
updated to 1 February 2000.



Part 2 GAZETTE OFFICIELLE DU QUÉBEC, July 15, 2000, Vol. 132, No. 28A 3617

Index Statutory Instruments

Abbreviations: A: Abrogated, N: New, M : Modified

Regulations — Statutes Page Comments

Family benefits  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 3615 M
(An Act respecting family benefits, R.S.Q., c. P-19.1)

Family benefits, An Act respecting… — Family benefits  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 3615 M
(R.S.Q., c. P-19.1)

Income support  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 3616 M
(An Act respecting income support, employment assistance and social solidarity,
R.S.Q., c. S-32.001)

Income support, employment assistance and social solidarity, An Act respecting…
— Income support  . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 3616 M
(R.S.Q., c. S-32.001)




